
Profile

 

I’m a studious and motivated developer with a 
strong interest in building resilient systems and 
great user experiences. I’m curious, learn 
quickly and work well on teams. Projects 
recognised by Ofsted and Innovate UK. 
Experienced in classrooms and startups, I like to 
move fast and think on my feet. 



Education

  

Web Development, Le Wagon, London

10/23 - 12/2�

� Successfully pitched my app concept and led 
four-person team on capstone projec�

� Recognised for collaboration and mentoring 
skills with invitation to join the course as TA


MA European History (Distinction),

King’s College London,

Humboldt-Universität zu Berlin

09/13 - 06/15


BA Latin, University of Oregon, USA

09/04 - 06/09



Languages

    English | Spanish | German | French | Italian


daniel.o.sussman@gmail.com


London, UK

 


https://daniel-sussman.github.io/profile/


https://www.linkedin.com/in/d-sussman/


https://github.com/daniel-sussman

Daniel Ozawa Sussman

Software Engineer

Skills


Projects


Professional Experience


 �

� Full-stack development: Python, Ruby/Rails, 
JavaScript, React, HTML/CSS, PostgreSQL, 
Redis, Heroku, REST/SOAP API�

� Testing: RSpec, Selenium, Capybar�
� Collaboration: Git/GitHub, Figma, Miro



 

Cheddar (2023-24�

� Full-stack developer on jobs platform linking 
graduates with eco-friendly employer�

� Rapidly prototyped core features, leading to 
seed funding from Innovate U�

� Developed API integrations with third-party 
jobs platforms and tracking system�

� Built CI pipeline with  unit, integration, and 
feature testing via GitHub Actions


Hero (2023)

�

� Led Agile development team on app to 
recommend family activities in Londo�

� Wrote predictive algorithms based on user 
behaviour to inform recommendations


Quizzy (2021-22)

�

� Quiz tournaments using differentiated 
teaching principles to boost learning and 
classroom engagemen�

� Recognised by Ofsted, the UK regulatory 
body for standards in education


 


  


Teaching Assistant, Le Wagon, London

01/24 - presen�

� Supporting the teaching of web development 
concepts and industry best practice�

� Mentoring to promote collaboration, 
teamwork, and problem-solving skills


Teacher of Classics and History

St Philip’s School, Scuola Italiana a Londra 
and private tutoring

09/17 - 09/2�

� Held teaching various posts, including Head 
of Classics at a small independent schoo�

� Praised by Ofsted for software I developed to 
improve learning and classroom engagement


 


